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EXCLUSIVE CUSTOMIZATION FOR THE NEW PORSCHE 911 (992.2) – By TECHART 

The new Porsche 911 (992.2) marks the next chapter in the evolution of an icon. And now, TECHART introduces a 
comprehensive refinement program to turn this automotive legend into a personal masterpiece. 

Where others see a sports car, TECHART sees a canvas. A place for individuality, performance, and unmatched 
character. With over three decades of expertise in high-end Porsche refinement, TECHART now unlocks a new level 
of personalization for the 911 (992.2) - combining motorsport-inspired design with craftsmanship, technology, and 
bold expression. 

Image 1: TECHART Aero Kit on 911 (992.2) Carrera



Image 2: TECHART Aero Kit & Heckspoiler III on 911 (992.2) Carrera

Design That Defines You: TECHART Carbon for the Exterior 

The TECHART exterior styling package reinterprets the iconic 911 silhouette with a suite of expressive aerodynamic 
parts, all crafted from either lightweight carbon fiber or PU/GRP.  

The 992.2 TECHART exterior Aero Kit includes: 

§ Front Splitter* § Roof Spoiler § Aero Hood

§ Aero Fender § Rear Diffuser* § Side Mirror Trims

§ Side Skirts § Aero Wings § Rear Spolier I

§ Rear Spoiler II § Rear Spoiler III *different versions for standard Carrera and 
GTS models

§ 

All designed to enhance both appearance and presence. 



Image 3: TECHART Aero Kit on 911 (992.2) GTS 

Image 4: TECHART Aero Kit & Heckspoiler III on 911 (992.2) GTS 

Each carbon part is available in glossy or matte finish and embodies TECHART’s uncompromising approach to 
design, quality and attention to detail.  



Individuality Inside: Carbon and Craftsmanship in the Interior 

On the inside, the 911 becomes a personal canvas. TECHART’s in-house saddlery transforms the interior with 
handcrafted details - from custom leather and Alcantara applications to unique contrast stitching and bespoke 
perforation patterns.  

Image 5: TECHART Steering Wheel Individualization for 911 (992.2) Image 6: TECHART Steering Wheel Individualization for 911 (992.2)

Carbon trim elements and painted inlays further enhance the interior architecture. Every material, surface, and accent 
can be tailored to the driver’s vision - creating an environment that feels as exclusive as it looks. 

Image 7: TECHART Carbon Interior Package for 911 (992.2) 

Stronger. Sharper. More Emotional: TECHART Powerkit and Suspension 



For drivers seeking even more performance, TECHART presents the new TECHTRONIC Powerkit for the Porsche 
911 (992.2) Carrera. It boosts output from 394 hp to 504 hp, and torque from 450 Nm to 550 Nm. Controlled via the 
standard drive mode switch, the system ensures maximum power on demand - while maintaining full compatibility 
with all safety and assistance systems. TECHTRONIC Powerkits for Carrera S and Carrera GTS models are in within 
their final development stages and will be available soon. 

Image 8: Performance chart TECHART TECHTRONIC Powerkit for 911 (992.2) Carrera

For enhanced driving dynamics and visual presence, TECHART offers a set of height-adjustable coilover spring kits. 
Designed specifically for the 911 (992.2), they allow for fine-tuned lowering and improved handling without 
compromising everyday usability. To improve daily usability, TECHART offers its own, renowed Noselift System for 
the 911 (992.2) models which also can be combined with aftermarket suspenion kits. 

Image 9: TECHART Noselift System

Sound You Can Feel: The TECHART Sport Exhaust System 



True performance speaks. But with the TECHART Sport Exhaust System, it roars. 

Image 10: TECHART Sports Exhaust System for 911 (992.2) Carrera and Carrera S 

Developed for maximum emotional appeal, the system features dynamic valve control that adjusts the exhaust note 
depending on the selected driving mode. From refined cruising tones to a commanding, motorsport-inspired roar - 
the TECHART sound experience delivers goosebumps on demand. 

Its integration into the 911 rear design is seamless - visually refined, acoustically unforgettable. 

Make Your 911 a Statement. 

With its latest customization program, TECHART once again redefines what’s possible in the world of Porsche 
refinement. From aerodynamic carbon styling to handcrafted interior upgrades, from performance enhancements to 
emotional sound - every element of the 911 becomes yours to define. 

Your 911. Made by TECHART. Beyond the Ordinary. 

About TECHART 

Founded in 1987, TECHART is the world’s leading refinement brand for Porsche vehicles. Based in Germany, 
TECHART combines engineering excellence with artistic craftsmanship to create truly individual automobiles. Every 
TECHART vehicle embodies precision, performance, and exclusivity - driven by a passion for pushing boundaries 
beyond the ordinary. 

https://www.techart.de/
mailto:m.schurr@techart.de

